
MacKenzie Whitsell <mackenziewhitsell@gmail.com>

Mailing Address
2 messages

MacKenzie Whitsell <mackenziewhitsell@gmail.com> Thu, Jul 15, 2021 at 10:12 PM
To: Joyce Gustavson <jgustavson@sterlingct.us>

Hi Joyce, I’m not sure who to ask about this so I’m hoping you can point me in the right direction. Our property and fire tax
bills were sent to the wrong address. How do I go about updating that? Here’s the info in case it’s something you can do. 

Property Address: 
130 old cranston road
sterling, CT

Mailing address: 
MacKenzie and Jesse Whitsell
390 Hammet Rd
Coventry, RI 02816

Thank you!

MacKenzie Whitsell
401-330-6924

On Mon, Jun 28, 2021 at 3:06 PM Joyce
 Gustavson <jgustavson@sterlingct.us> wrote:

Good afternoon

I was on vacation last week and I am not sure if my assistant answered your email regarding payment and she is out
until Wednesday.

Please let me know if you need me to answer this.

Joyce

 

From: Kyle Collins <kcollins@sterlingct.us>
Sent: Thursday, June 24, 2021 6:11 AM
To: MacKenzie Whitsell <mackenziewhitsell@gmail.com>; Joyce Gustavson <jgustavson@sterlingct.us>; Susanne
Tetreault <STetreault@sterlingct.us>
Subject: Re: Permit Application

 

Hi MacKenzie,

I am not sure if you can pay on-line or over the phone.  Joyce G. in the main office would know 
(860-564-2904).  The fee is $35.00 payable to: Town of Sterling.  

Kyle

 

From: MacKenzie Whitsell <mackenziewhitsell@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2021 2:38 PM
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To: Kyle Collins <kcollins@sterlingct.us>
Subject: Permit Application

 

Hi, my application is attached. Do I need to drop off a check or is there a way to pay the fee online?

 

Thank you,

 

MacKenzie Whitsell

130 old cranston rd

401-330-6924

Joyce Gustavson <jgustavson@sterlingct.us> Fri, Jul 16, 2021 at 7:51 PM
To: MacKenzie Whitsell <mackenziewhitsell@gmail.com>
Cc: Sandra Lisee <slisee@sterlingct.us>, "sterlingtax@atlanticbbn.net" <sterlingtax@atlanticbbn.net>

I have cc’d your email to Sandra Lisee, Sterling Revenue Collector and Karen Vincent, Sterling Fire District Tax Collector.

If you need to speak to Karen, she is at the Fire Station on Main Street, every Wednesday from 6:00 p.m. to 8:00 p.m.
and every Saturday in July from 9:00 a.m. to noon.

If you have any questions, please reach out to Sandra or Karen.

Joyce

[Quoted text hidden]
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